BID TABULATION

FOR

GURLEY WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS

DW ARPA

PROJECT NO. FS$101428-01

FOR

THE TOWN OF GURLEY

BID DATE: THURSDAY, AUGUST 28, 2025 AT 1:00 P.M. CDT

TOTAL BASE

BIDDER BID SCHEDULE ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1
1 Bolt Contracting 3 87224500 | $ 21,000.00
2 Powell Builders, Inc. 1,097,370.00 43,800.00
3 Centerline Contracting, Inc. 1,193.151.76 100,976.35
4 MGL, Inc. 1,199,324.72 20,598.30
5 Lambert, Inc. I1.242,197.14 81,213.89
6 Lambert Contracting, LLC 1.447,810.00 58.480.00
7 McCord Construction, Inc. 1.531,209.00 20,000.00
8 Talley Lambert Construction, LLC 1,805,700.00 104,000.00
9 Contractor Service and Fabrication, Inc. NO BID NO BID
10 |Eady Contracting, Inc. NO BID NO BID
11 |Hereford Construction, LLC NO BID NO BID
12 |Price Civil Services, inc. NO BID NO BID
13 |Templeton Associates NO BID NO BID
14 |[Tren-Tay Inc. NO BID NO BID

| hereby certify, that to the best of my knowledge and belief, that the above is a true and correct tabulation of the
totals of all bids received during the above referenced bid opening. | also certify that all bids have been checked for

CERTIFICATION

mathematical errors and any errors have been corrected and so reflected in the totals.

LAD&DKKNMEN AL CONSULTANTS, INC.

Adam Lea, P.E.

1926



