BID TABULATION

FOR

CONTRACT NO. 2 - WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS AND TANK REHABILITATION

FOR

THE CROSSVILLE WATERWORKS BOARD

BID DATE: THURSDAY, DECEMBER 5, 2024 AT 2:00 P.M. CST

19232

ALTERNATIVE ALTERNATIVE
TOTAL ALTERNATES TO BID TOTAL ALTERNATES TO BID

BIDDER BID SCHEDULE "A" SCHEDULE "A" BID SCHEDULE "B" SCHEDULE "B"
1 Tank Pro,_Inc. 3 288,158.00 | § 667.00 NO BID NO BID
2 Currens Construction Services, LLC 333,700.00 6.500.00 667.550.00 5,100.00
3 |Robinson & Sons Construction Services, Inc. 387.600.00 10,000.00 757,500.00 10,000.00
4 Viking Painting, LLC 393.900.00 6,500.00 832,400.00 3.100.00
5 Classic Protective Coatings, Inc. 461,950.00 14,300.00 894.475.00 15,900.00
[¢] USG Water NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify, that to the best of my knowledge and belief, that the above is a true and correct tabulation of the totals of all bids received during the above
referenced bid opening. | also certify that all bids have been checked for mathematical errors and any errors have been corrected and so reflected in the
totals.

LADD ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS, INC.
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James Payton, P.E.



