BID TABULATION

WATER STORAGE TANK REHABILITATION

THE WATERWORKS BOARD OF THE TOWN OF VALLEY HEAD

BID DATE: THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 8, 2024 AT 2:00 P.M. CST

1928

BIDDER TOTAL BID ALTERNATE NO. 1

1 |Preferred Sandblasting and Painting, LLC $ 138,750.00 | $ 1,000.00
2 |Dixie Painting and Sandblasting, Inc. 156,761.00 2,500.00
3 |Tank Pro, Inc. 175,732.00 5,108.00
4 |G &L Tank, Sandblasting and Coatings, LLC 193,450.00 6,000.00
5 |Robinson & Sons Construction Services, Inc. 222,400.00 4,000.00
6 |Worldwide Industries Corp. 222,980.00 8,890.00
7 |Utility Service Co., Inc. 236,200.00 1,400.00
8 |TANKREHAB.COM, LLC 264,000.00 2,000.00
. 9 |Classic Protective Coatings, LLC 288,630.00 28,750.00
10 |MaGuire Iron, Inc. NO BID NO BID
11 |Viking Painting, LLC NO BID NO BID

CERTIFICATION

’I hereby certify, that to the best of my knowledge and belief, that the above is a true and correct tabulation of the totals of all
‘bids received during the above referenced bid opening. | also certify that all bids have been checked for mathematical errors

and any errors have been corrected and so reflected in the totals.

LADD ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS, INC.

fumsd Py

~James Payton, P.E.




